
UK meat processing equipment company
AEW Delford Systems has now launched
complete meat processing lines for fast
and efficient product production.

The Italian manufacturers of machinery,
plants and equipment for food production,
processing and preservation are optimistic
about the future. The challenge for the next
two years involves new markets, large-scale
distribution and niche markets to be met
through top performance of the industry.

In a world witnessing an increase of
diet-related diseases, processed foods are
included among the major culprits. For the
meat sector, the main issues revolve around
high fat and sodium contento The trouble,
however, is that those elements are also
related to valued sensory characteristics.

27 Slicing
Food processors are challenged to deliver
convenience food products at the most
competitive prices, together with a huge
variety in regards to portion forms and
package styles.

These arlicles can also be downloaded al
www.meatinlernalional.com/arlicle·dalabase
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